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“We are our bodies”, “we have our
bodies”, “we make our bodies”. This
“three-headed” axiom has made the
body the “parasite” of modern
culture.

“Reclaiming the social throughout
embodied practices” (Greenwood,
1994) is basical ly the ultimate
objective of this book. The thinking,
feel ing and acting body wil l figure
as prominently as the mind,
cognition, and rational ity in comb-
ining the framework of the research
and the methodology underpinning
its development.
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Bianca Maria Pirani is Professor of
Sociology of Cultural Networks at
“Sapienza” University of Rome.

“Her new book is a tour de force in
the exploration of the relationship
between evolution, cultural anth-
ropology and sociology. I t i s
original , thought-provoking, beaut-
i ful ly written, and ful l of unique
insights into how the past blends
with the future in the journey that
is human civi l ization.”

—Elkhonon Goldberg, author of
The Executive Brain
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